SUBJECT TO APPROVAL

SOUTHBURY BOARD OF SELECTMEN
December 21, 2023

RESOLVED, that the Board of Selectmen, upon the
recommendation of the Public Works Director, hereby
awards the bid for Pavement Reclamation & Preservation to
Lafferty Enterprises Inc. (DBA Harwinton Paving).



TOWN OF SOUTHBURY

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
501 Main Street South
Southbury, Connecticut 06488
(203) 262-0622
Fax: (203) 262-1588

Date: December 18, 2023

To: Board of Selectmen

From: Blake Leonard, Public Works Director @f{/
Re: RFP 2023-014: Pavement Reclamation & Preservation

Five bids for Pavement Reclamation & Preservation were received on December 14,
2023. Present at the bid opening were Tom Farrelly and Matt Tarnowski, DPW. Also
present were Annie Hall of Asphalt Repair Solutions, Inc., Ed Burns of Burns
Construction Company, Inc., Cathy Jensen of B&W Paving & Landscaping, LLC, and
Kevin Starchak of S+S Asphalt Paving, Inc. Bids were solicited for various elements of
paving projects, including reclaiming, sectional milling & paving, and asphalt supply.

Based on the bids received, it is our recommendation that the bid be awarded to Lafferty
Enterprises, Inc. (DBA Harwinton Paving). Harwinton Paving has significant experience
in the paving field and worked for the town this summer on paving projects. Please see
the attached sheets detailing each bid received and an extended cost estimate.

If you have any questions please let me know.



RFP 2023-014: Pavement | Asphalt Burns B&W Paving | Harwinton S+S

Reclamation & Repair Construction | & Paving Asphalt

Preservation Solutions | Company, Landscaping | (Lafferty Paving,
Inc. Inc. LLC Enterprises) | Inc.

1 | Reclaiming $5.25/SY $5.70/SY $6.00/S5Y $3.50/SY $5.24/SY

2 | Sectional milling $5.15/SY $2.85/SY $15.00/SY $1.75/SY $9.89/SY

3 | Sectional paving, $52.98/ton | $22.75/ton $120.00/ton | $20.50/ton $68.90/ton

machine-spread
4 | Sectional paving, hand- $170.00/ton | $49.25/ton $250.00/ton | $145.00/ton | $224.00/ton

spread

Tom Farrelly,
Matt Tarnowski

5 [ Supply Class 1 asphalt NO BID $103.18/ton | $82.00/ton $82.00/ton $82.00/ton
6 | Supply class 2 asphalt NO BID $110.39/ton $88.15/ton $88.15/ton $88.15/ton
7 | Supply S0.5 asphalt NO BID $102.01/ton | $81.00/ton $81.00/ton $81.00/ton
8 | Supply S0.375 asphalt NO BID $107.58/ton | $85.75/ton $85.75/ton $85.75/ton
Note: S+S

Witnessed by: also bid a

paving price
of
$22.39/ton
for
reclaiming
jobs.




Projected/Estimated Extended Cost Comparison

Asphalt Repair

Burns Construction

B&W Paving &

Harwinton Paving

S+S Asphalt Paving,

Solutions Inc. Company, Inc. Landscaping LLC (Lafferty Inc.
Enterprises)
Item | Units | Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended unit Extended Unit Extended
Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost
1 13000 | $5.25 $68,250.00 | $5.70 | $74,100.00 | $6.00 $78,000.00 | $3.50 $45,500.00 | $5.24 $68,120.00
2 5300 | $5.15 $27,295.00 | $2.85 |$15,105.00 | $15.00 | $79,500.00 | $1.75 $9,275.00 $9.89 $52,417.00
3 450 $52.98 | $23,841.00 | $22.75 | $10,237.50 | $120.00 | $54,000.00 | $20.50 | $9,225.00 $68.90 | $31,005.00
4 150 $170.00 | $25,500.00 | $49.25 | $7,387.50 $250.00 | $37,500.00 | $145.00 | $21,750.00 | $224.00 | $33,600.00
Total $144,886.00 $106,830.00 $249,000.00 $85,750.00 $185,142.00
Cost:

Note: Items 5-8 were optional and not factored into the estimated extended costs.




